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This well-established and widely adopted textbook, now in its 13th edition, continues to provide an in-depth
and insightful analysis of the modern theories and practices of cost accounting. That the book has gone into
its 13th edition is a testimony of its wide acceptance by the students, academics and professionals. Primarily
intended for postgraduate and undergraduate students of commerce and management, the book will be of
immense benefit to the students pursuing professional courses offered by the institute of chartered
accountants of india (icai), institute of cost accountants of india (icai), institute of company secretaries of
india (icsi) and those pursuing the chartered financial analyst (cfa) course. Now, in its 13th edition, the book
has been thoroughly revised meeting the latest syllabus requirement of various courses. A new chapter on
"strategic cost management" has been included which is a definite need of modern management to enhance
the competitive advantage of the firm. Besides, many chapters have been overhauled and updated, especially
the chapters covering basic concepts and terms, classification of costs and cost sheet, activity based costing,
marginal costing, relevant cost analysis and management decisions, capital budgeting decisions and cost
audit. The book also includes terminology published by cima, the cost standards recommended by icai and a
wide array of illustrations, worked-out examples, mcqs and practice exercises.
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From reader reviews:

Travis Wysocki:

Have you spare time for the day? What do you do when you have much more or little spare time? That's
why, you can choose the suitable activity intended for spend your time. Any person spent their spare time to
take a stroll, shopping, or went to the Mall. How about open or maybe read a book entitled Cost Accounting:
Theory and Practice? Maybe it is for being best activity for you. You already know beside you can spend
your time together with your favorite's book, you can cleverer than before. Do you agree with the opinion or
you have various other opinion?

Alonzo Stark:

Book is definitely written, printed, or descriptive for everything. You can know everything you want by a
guide. Book has a different type. We all know that that book is important matter to bring us around the
world. Next to that you can your reading skill was fluently. A e-book Cost Accounting: Theory and Practice
will make you to be smarter. You can feel far more confidence if you can know about every thing. But some
of you think that open or reading a book make you bored. It isn't make you fun. Why they might be thought
like that? Have you in search of best book or suitable book with you?

Linda Gordon:

Here thing why this particular Cost Accounting: Theory and Practice are different and reliable to be yours.
First of all looking at a book is good nonetheless it depends in the content of it which is the content is as
delightful as food or not. Cost Accounting: Theory and Practice giving you information deeper since
different ways, you can find any publication out there but there is no book that similar with Cost Accounting:
Theory and Practice. It gives you thrill looking at journey, its open up your eyes about the thing this
happened in the world which is possibly can be happened around you. It is easy to bring everywhere like in
area, café, or even in your means home by train. In case you are having difficulties in bringing the paper
book maybe the form of Cost Accounting: Theory and Practice in e-book can be your alternate.

Lowell Seymour:

A lot of people always spent their own free time to vacation or go to the outside with them family or their
friend. Do you know? Many a lot of people spent these people free time just watching TV, as well as playing
video games all day long. If you need to try to find a new activity that's look different you can read a new
book. It is really fun in your case. If you enjoy the book that you simply read you can spent the entire day to
reading a guide. The book Cost Accounting: Theory and Practice it is extremely good to read. There are a lot
of those who recommended this book. They were enjoying reading this book. When you did not have enough
space to develop this book you can buy typically the e-book. You can m0ore effortlessly to read this book
through your smart phone. The price is not to fund but this book possesses high quality.
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