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of the original book (without typos) from the publisher. Not indexed. Not illustrated. 1915 Excerpt: ...about
four thousand five hundred years B.C. In this record three alphabetic characters are employed to spell that
monarch's name. But in November 1897, Dr. Borchardt reported the important discovery that the royal tomb
found by M. de Morgan in the spring of that year at Nagada, situate opposite Coptos, a little north of Thebes,
is that of Menes, the founder of the First Dynasty, whose date Professor Flinders Petrie fixes at 4777 B.C.,
"with a possible error of a century." Calcined remains of the body are now in the Gizeh Museum, and, among
other objects, the broken fragments of an ivory plaque which, when joined, showed the ka name of Aha (the
ka being the "double" or "other self "of the deceased which abode with the mummy), and, attached thereto,
the name MN--Menes, borne by the Pharaoh during his lifetime. Assuming that Dr. Borchardt's
interpretation is accepted by Egyptologists, it proves that the hieroglyphic system of writing was then already
fully developed. It may be remarked, incidentally, that among the remains of the predynastic race discovered
by Professor Flinders Petrie in 1895, in the district north of Thebes, no hieroglyphs or traces of other writing
were found. There was evidence of knowledge of metals, but not of the potter's wheel. It therefore seems
probable that writing came in with the First Dynasty, which, according to M. de Morgan, was descended
from Chaldean Semites. But more interesting, for the light thrown on early Egyptian thought, than
inscriptions on steel or plaque are the copies of portions of the sacred literature entitled "Chapters of the
Coming Forth by Day," and also the " Chapters of Making Strong the Beatified Spirit," but commonly
known as the Book of the Dead. This ven...
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From reader reviews:

Michael Duckett:

Have you spare time for just a day? What do you do when you have more or little spare time? Yeah, you can
choose the suitable activity for spend your time. Any person spent their very own spare time to take a move,
shopping, or went to often the Mall. How about open or read a book eligible The story of the alphabet, with
ninety illustrations? Maybe it is to become best activity for you. You understand beside you can spend your
time with the favorite's book, you can more intelligent than before. Do you agree with it is opinion or you
have different opinion?

Jon Gomes:

Are you kind of occupied person, only have 10 or perhaps 15 minute in your day time to upgrading your
mind expertise or thinking skill possibly analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book
than can satisfy your short time to read it because this time you only find book that need more time to be
read. The story of the alphabet, with ninety illustrations can be your answer as it can be read by you who
have those short time problems.

Johnnie McCormick:

That book can make you to feel relax. This kind of book The story of the alphabet, with ninety illustrations
was multi-colored and of course has pictures on there. As we know that book The story of the alphabet, with
ninety illustrations has many kinds or category. Start from kids until adolescents. For example Naruto or
Private eye Conan you can read and think you are the character on there. Therefore not at all of book tend to
be make you bored, any it offers you feel happy, fun and relax. Try to choose the best book for you
personally and try to like reading that.

Hazel Makowski:

Reading a book make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information from a
book. Book is written or printed or descriptive from each source in which filled update of news. Within this
modern era like today, many ways to get information are available for a person. From media social such as
newspaper, magazines, science e-book, encyclopedia, reference book, story and comic. You can add your
knowledge by that book. Do you want to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just seeking the The
story of the alphabet, with ninety illustrations when you needed it?
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