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A young mother dies in agony. Was it a natural death, murder—or witchcraft?

On the night of the festive holiday of Shrove Tuesday in 1672 Anna Fessler died after eating one of her
neighbor's buttery cakes. Could it have been poisoned? Drawing on vivid court documents, eyewitness
accounts, and an early autopsy report, historian Thomas Robisheaux brings the story to life. Exploring one of
Europe's last witch panics, he unravels why neighbors and the court magistrates became convinced that
Fessler's neighbor Anna Schmieg was a witch—one of several in the area—ensnared by the devil. Once
arrested, Schmieg, the wife of the local miller, and her daughter were caught up in a high-stakes drama that
led to charges of sorcery and witchcraft against the entire family. Robisheaux shows how ordinary events
became diabolical ones, leading magistrates to torture and turn a daughter against her mother. In so doing he
portrays an entire world caught between superstition and modernity.
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From reader reviews:

Dawn Spigner:

The book The Last Witch of Langenburg: Murder in a German Village make you feel enjoy for your spare
time. You can utilize to make your capable a lot more increase. Book can being your best friend when you
getting pressure or having big problem along with your subject. If you can make reading a book The Last
Witch of Langenburg: Murder in a German Village to be your habit, you can get considerably more
advantages, like add your capable, increase your knowledge about several or all subjects. You are able to
know everything if you like available and read a guide The Last Witch of Langenburg: Murder in a German
Village. Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science e-book or encyclopedia or some others. So , how
do you think about this publication?

George Seal:

What do you think about book? It is just for students since they are still students or the idea for all people in
the world, what the best subject for that? Simply you can be answered for that concern above. Every person
has distinct personality and hobby for each other. Don't to be compelled someone or something that they
don't wish do that. You must know how great as well as important the book The Last Witch of Langenburg:
Murder in a German Village. All type of book can you see on many resources. You can look for the internet
solutions or other social media.

Steven Cordell:

The guide with title The Last Witch of Langenburg: Murder in a German Village has a lot of information that
you can discover it. You can get a lot of help after read this book. This book exist new knowledge the
information that exist in this guide represented the condition of the world at this point. That is important to
yo7u to be aware of how the improvement of the world. That book will bring you in new era of the
globalization. You can read the e-book in your smart phone, so you can read the idea anywhere you want.

Tamela Campbell:

Book is one of source of information. We can add our know-how from it. Not only for students but in
addition native or citizen will need book to know the change information of year to be able to year. As we
know those guides have many advantages. Beside most of us add our knowledge, could also bring us to
around the world. By the book The Last Witch of Langenburg: Murder in a German Village we can have
more advantage. Don't that you be creative people? For being creative person must prefer to read a book. Just
choose the best book that appropriate with your aim. Don't be doubt to change your life with that book The
Last Witch of Langenburg: Murder in a German Village. You can more pleasing than now.
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