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Wanda Jean Milton discovers her husband, local exterminator Hilton Milton, dead on her new shag carpet
with an Old Hickory carving knife sticking out of his chest. Beside herself over how she’ll remove the stain,
and grief-stricken over Hilton’s demise, Wanda Jean finds herself the prime suspect in the case. But she is
also a member of “the” local Study Club, a bastion of independent Texas feminism 1960s style. Club
President Clara Wyler has no intention of allowing a member to be a murder suspect during her
administration. Aided by her younger sister and County Clerk, Mae Ella Gormley; Sugar Watson, the
proprietress of Sugar’s Style and Spray; and Wilma Schneider, Army MASH veteran and local RN, the Club
women set out to clear Wanda Jean’s name — never guessing the local dirt they’ll uncover in the process.
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From reader reviews:

Nellie Davis:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important action, like
looking for your favorite e-book and reading a guide. Beside you can solve your long lasting problem; you
can add your knowledge by the book entitled You Can't Get Blood Out of Shag Carpet: A Study Club Cozy
Murder Mystery (The Study Club Mysteries Book 1). Try to face the book You Can't Get Blood Out of Shag
Carpet: A Study Club Cozy Murder Mystery (The Study Club Mysteries Book 1) as your buddy. It means
that it can for being your friend when you experience alone and beside that course make you smarter than
ever before. Yeah, it is very fortuned to suit your needs. The book makes you considerably more confidence
because you can know every thing by the book. So , let us make new experience in addition to knowledge
with this book.

Ray Chung:

What do you think about book? It is just for students because they're still students or the item for all people
in the world, the actual best subject for that? Simply you can be answered for that problem above. Every
person has various personality and hobby for each other. Don't to be forced someone or something that they
don't need do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book You Can't Get Blood Out of
Shag Carpet: A Study Club Cozy Murder Mystery (The Study Club Mysteries Book 1). All type of book
could you see on many sources. You can look for the internet methods or other social media.

Dennis James:

In this 21st millennium, people become competitive in every way. By being competitive at this point, people
have do something to make these people survives, being in the middle of the particular crowded place and
notice by simply surrounding. One thing that sometimes many people have underestimated that for a while is
reading. That's why, by reading a reserve your ability to survive increase then having chance to stand up than
other is high. For you who want to start reading the book, we give you this particular You Can't Get Blood
Out of Shag Carpet: A Study Club Cozy Murder Mystery (The Study Club Mysteries Book 1) book as nice
and daily reading e-book. Why, because this book is more than just a book.

Marcella Cook:

Are you kind of busy person, only have 10 or 15 minute in your morning to upgrading your mind talent or
thinking skill also analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book than can satisfy your
short time to read it because this all time you only find e-book that need more time to be learn. You Can't
Get Blood Out of Shag Carpet: A Study Club Cozy Murder Mystery (The Study Club Mysteries Book 1) can
be your answer mainly because it can be read by you actually who have those short spare time problems.
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