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Despite the fact that the Civil War began over 150 years ago, Americans continue to be fascinated by the
Civil War icons who made the difference between victory and defeat in the war's great battles.
While all eyes were fixed on the Eastern theater at places like Manassas, Richmond, the Shenandoah Valley
and Antietam, Ulysses S. Grant went about a steady rise up the ranks through a series of successes in the
West. Grant eventually came east to face Lee in 1864, bringing one of his most capable generals, Phil
Sheridan, with him to lead the cavalry. Ultimately, Grant and Sheridan forced Lee's surrender in 1865,
ensuring they'd be forever recognized two of the Union's greatest generals.
Synonymous with barbarity in the South, William Tecumseh Sherman is lauded as a war hero in the North,
and modern historians consider him the harbinger of total war. Military historian B. H. Liddell Hart famously
declared that Sherman was "the first modern general."
While there is a never ending stream of acclaim going to generals like Grant, Lee, and Sherman, General
George H. Thomas has managed to fly under the radar. Thomas scored almost inconceivable successes at
Missionary Ridge, Franklin, and Nashville. Thomas also skillfully fought at Perryville, Stones River, and in
Sherman’s Atlanta Campaign, but he's best remembered as “The Rock of Chickamauga”. Thomas’ heroics
prevented the destruction of the Union army at that battle and allowed it to successfully retreat to
Chattanooga.
Ironically, one of the generals who often escapes the attention of Civil War fans who compile the lists of best
generals is the man who won the war’s most famous battle, George G. Meade (1815-1872). In fact, Meade
has become a perfect example of how the generals who did not self-promote themselves and write memoirs
after the war had their reputations suffer in the ensuing decades. When people think of Appomattox Court
House, they think of Ulysses S. Grant and Robert E. Lee. Few remember that the commander of the Army of
the Potomac at the end of the Civil War was not Grant but Meade.
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From reader reviews:

Tina Brookins:

In this 21st millennium, people become competitive in most way. By being competitive at this point, people
have do something to make all of them survives, being in the middle of the particular crowded place and
notice simply by surrounding. One thing that sometimes many people have underestimated this for a while is
reading. Yep, by reading a book your ability to survive raise then having chance to stand than other is high.
In your case who want to start reading some sort of book, we give you this kind of The Top 5 Greatest Union
Generals: Ulysses S. Grant, William Tecumseh Sherman, George H. Thomas, George Meade, and Phil
Sheridan book as basic and daily reading publication. Why, because this book is greater than just a book.

Gene Baker:

Nowadays reading books become more and more than want or need but also turn into a life style. This
reading habit give you lot of advantages. Associate programs you got of course the knowledge your
information inside the book which improve your knowledge and information. The info you get based on
what kind of reserve you read, if you want send more knowledge just go with knowledge books but if you
want really feel happy read one together with theme for entertaining for example comic or novel. The actual
The Top 5 Greatest Union Generals: Ulysses S. Grant, William Tecumseh Sherman, George H. Thomas,
George Meade, and Phil Sheridan is kind of guide which is giving the reader unforeseen experience.

Lois Bottoms:

Exactly why? Because this The Top 5 Greatest Union Generals: Ulysses S. Grant, William Tecumseh
Sherman, George H. Thomas, George Meade, and Phil Sheridan is an unordinary book that the inside of the
reserve waiting for you to snap the idea but latter it will jolt you with the secret the item inside. Reading this
book next to it was fantastic author who have write the book in such incredible way makes the content
interior easier to understand, entertaining way but still convey the meaning entirely. So , it is good for you
because of not hesitating having this anymore or you going to regret it. This book will give you a lot of
positive aspects than the other book have such as help improving your talent and your critical thinking
method. So , still want to hold up having that book? If I were you I will go to the book store hurriedly.

Ophelia Ellis:

The Top 5 Greatest Union Generals: Ulysses S. Grant, William Tecumseh Sherman, George H. Thomas,
George Meade, and Phil Sheridan can be one of your starter books that are good idea. Most of us recommend
that straight away because this guide has good vocabulary that can increase your knowledge in vocabulary,
easy to understand, bit entertaining but nonetheless delivering the information. The copy writer giving
his/her effort to put every word into pleasure arrangement in writing The Top 5 Greatest Union Generals:
Ulysses S. Grant, William Tecumseh Sherman, George H. Thomas, George Meade, and Phil Sheridan but
doesn't forget the main stage, giving the reader the hottest in addition to based confirm resource data that



maybe you can be certainly one of it. This great information can certainly drawn you into completely new
stage of crucial considering.
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