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~ A Western Romance Short from the best selling author of "Addie and the Gunslinger", "Texas Promise",
and "Texas True" ~

A desperate man...
A woman on the run...
A surprising perfect match...

Kathleen Parker arrives in Trinity Hill, Texas, as a Mail Order Bride. But the name on the contract is not
hers. She has good reason to be on the run, and taking another woman's place and name seems like the
perfect foil.

Josiah Fremont is desperate for a wife, a woman who will cook, care for his three children, and generally be
a helpmate on his newly purchased ranch. He learns his mail order bride waits at the hotel.

Kathleen and Josiah discover a mutual attraction but decide to hold off on marriage. Under the name on the
contract – Gwendolyn – she decides to join him and his family for a few weeks while planning her next
move. She fears bringing harm to the children and Josiah.

A man with revenge in his heart and a gun on his hip brings danger to everyone. When Josiah learns
Kathleen's real identity, he struggles to make right choices that will benefit his family and the woman in his
heart.
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From reader reviews:

Thomas Fleischmann:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation or perhaps go to the outside with them family or their
friend. Do you realize? Many a lot of people spent these people free time just watching TV, or even playing
video games all day long. If you need to try to find a new activity that is look different you can read a new
book. It is really fun for you. If you enjoy the book you read you can spent the entire day to reading a guide.
The book Kathleen (Trinity Hill Brides Book 1) it doesn't matter what good to read. There are a lot of those
who recommended this book. These people were enjoying reading this book. In the event you did not have
enough space to deliver this book you can buy often the e-book. You can m0ore effortlessly to read this book
from your smart phone. The price is not to cover but this book has high quality.

Jeannine Ricks:

Why? Because this Kathleen (Trinity Hill Brides Book 1) is an unordinary book that the inside of the guide
waiting for you to snap it but latter it will jolt you with the secret the item inside. Reading this book beside it
was fantastic author who have write the book in such wonderful way makes the content within easier to
understand, entertaining approach but still convey the meaning entirely. So , it is good for you for not
hesitating having this any longer or you going to regret it. This excellent book will give you a lot of gains
than the other book possess such as help improving your talent and your critical thinking technique. So , still
want to postpone having that book? If I had been you I will go to the publication store hurriedly.

Christopher Sanchez:

Many people spending their time by playing outside having friends, fun activity together with family or just
watching TV the whole day. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by studying a book. Ugh, ya
think reading a book can really hard because you have to take the book everywhere? It alright you can have
the e-book, bringing everywhere you want in your Smart phone. Like Kathleen (Trinity Hill Brides Book 1)
which is getting the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's notice.

Deanna Marcantel:

This Kathleen (Trinity Hill Brides Book 1) is fresh way for you who has curiosity to look for some
information as it relief your hunger info. Getting deeper you in it getting knowledge more you know
otherwise you who still having little bit of digest in reading this Kathleen (Trinity Hill Brides Book 1) can be
the light food for yourself because the information inside this kind of book is easy to get simply by anyone.
These books build itself in the form and that is reachable by anyone, that's why I mean in the e-book type.
People who think that in reserve form make them feel sleepy even dizzy this publication is the answer. So
there is absolutely no in reading a guide especially this one. You can find what you are looking for. It should
be here for anyone. So , don't miss the idea! Just read this e-book variety for your better life and also
knowledge.
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