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This well-documented book discusses the domestic politics of treaty reform in the European Union, from the
failed referendums on the Constitutional Treaty held in France and the Netherlands in May-June 2005 to the
initial rejection of the Treaty of Lisbon in Ireland in June 2008. The chapters, written by some of the finest
scholars in the field of EU/European politics, show how European integration has increasingly become a
contested issue in a majority of Member States. Going beyond the view that national governments are the
main, if not the sole, driving force in the process of European integration, this book shows that other actors
and factors have played a central role in preference formation and inter-state bargaining. These include:
political parties, public opinion, the media, presidents, constitutional courts and, more broadly, political
systems, ratification hurdles and the general negotiation context. "National Politics and European
Integration" combines empirical analysis and theoretical explanations for one of the most controversial
periods in the history of the European Union. This important book will be of great interest for advanced
students in EU studies, comparative politics and public policy.
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From reader reviews:

Brittany Belliveau:

Throughout other case, little persons like to read book National Politics and European Integration: From the
Constitution to the Lisbon Treaty. You can choose the best book if you appreciate reading a book. Provided
that we know about how is important any book National Politics and European Integration: From the
Constitution to the Lisbon Treaty. You can add information and of course you can around the world by the
book. Absolutely right, since from book you can recognize everything! From your country until eventually
foreign or abroad you can be known. About simple issue until wonderful thing you could know that. In this
era, we are able to open a book or even searching by internet unit. It is called e-book. You can utilize it when
you feel fed up to go to the library. Let's examine.

Emma Patterson:

The ability that you get from National Politics and European Integration: From the Constitution to the Lisbon
Treaty is a more deep you looking the information that hide within the words the more you get thinking
about reading it. It does not mean that this book is hard to comprehend but National Politics and European
Integration: From the Constitution to the Lisbon Treaty giving you joy feeling of reading. The copy writer
conveys their point in certain way that can be understood by simply anyone who read this because the author
of this guide is well-known enough. This specific book also makes your current vocabulary increase well.
Making it easy to understand then can go to you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We
recommend you for having this kind of National Politics and European Integration: From the Constitution to
the Lisbon Treaty instantly.

Lisa Sullivan:

That reserve can make you to feel relax. This particular book National Politics and European Integration:
From the Constitution to the Lisbon Treaty was colorful and of course has pictures on there. As we know
that book National Politics and European Integration: From the Constitution to the Lisbon Treaty has many
kinds or type. Start from kids until teens. For example Naruto or Investigation company Conan you can read
and feel that you are the character on there. Therefore , not at all of book are make you bored, any it offers
you feel happy, fun and relax. Try to choose the best book for you and try to like reading this.

Joaquin Bedard:

A lot of guide has printed but it takes a different approach. You can get it by online on social media. You can
choose the very best book for you, science, comedy, novel, or whatever by means of searching from it. It is
referred to as of book National Politics and European Integration: From the Constitution to the Lisbon
Treaty. You can add your knowledge by it. Without leaving behind the printed book, it might add your
knowledge and make you happier to read. It is most critical that, you must aware about publication. It can
bring you from one location to other place.
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