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NEW YORK TIMES BESTSELLER • In Danielle Steel’s thrilling novel, a woman’s legacy—shaped by
tragedy, fortitude, and undying devotion—transforms lives and hearts long after she is gone, and
fulfills at last her most precious bequest.
 
Faded photographs of a glamorous couple in postwar Europe. Old letters hinting of tragic loss. And a
breathtaking array of magnificent jewelry, spectacular stones in exquisite settings. These are the contents of a
safe-deposit box long abandoned in a New York City bank. If no heir can be identified, the jewelry will be
auctioned. But who was the woman who left such a fortune and no will?
 
Two people, drawn together by chance, begin to unravel the mystery. Jane Willoughby is a law clerk at the
surrogate’s court and Phillip Lawton a fine arts expert for Christie’s auction house. They are simply doing
their jobs when they come to the bank to inspect the contents of the box. But for both Jane and Phillip the
search turns personal—and their efforts to reconstruct an enigmatic life will lead from New York to London
and Paris, to Rome and Naples, and a series of stunning revelations.
 
Eighteen-year-old Marguerite Pearson left America with a broken heart in the shadow of World War II. She
found a new life in Europe but forever mourned what she left behind. As the truth about Marguerite’s
extraordinary history—her forbidden love affair and her family’s treachery—is slowly revealed, more people
are drawn into the puzzle that Jane and Phillip have pieced together, and one among them will inherit the
most unexpected gift of all.

From the Hardcover edition.
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From reader reviews:

Henry Robinson:

What do you think of book? It is just for students as they are still students or that for all people in the world,
exactly what the best subject for that? Just you can be answered for that query above. Every person has
diverse personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be compelled someone or something that
they don't desire do that. You must know how great along with important the book Property of a
Noblewoman: A Novel (Random House Large Print). All type of book could you see on many sources. You
can look for the internet sources or other social media.

Harold Cole:

Here thing why this Property of a Noblewoman: A Novel (Random House Large Print) are different and
trustworthy to be yours. First of all reading a book is good nonetheless it depends in the content from it
which is the content is as delicious as food or not. Property of a Noblewoman: A Novel (Random House
Large Print) giving you information deeper and different ways, you can find any reserve out there but there is
no publication that similar with Property of a Noblewoman: A Novel (Random House Large Print). It gives
you thrill reading through journey, its open up your current eyes about the thing that happened in the world
which is might be can be happened around you. You can bring everywhere like in recreation area, café, or
even in your method home by train. When you are having difficulties in bringing the imprinted book maybe
the form of Property of a Noblewoman: A Novel (Random House Large Print) in e-book can be your choice.

Bettie Hentges:

The book Property of a Noblewoman: A Novel (Random House Large Print) will bring one to the new
experience of reading a book. The author style to spell out the idea is very unique. When you try to find new
book to see, this book very appropriate to you. The book Property of a Noblewoman: A Novel (Random
House Large Print) is much recommended to you to study. You can also get the e-book in the official web
site, so you can easier to read the book.

Clara Brownfield:

Property of a Noblewoman: A Novel (Random House Large Print) can be one of your basic books that are
good idea. All of us recommend that straight away because this guide has good vocabulary that will increase
your knowledge in language, easy to understand, bit entertaining however delivering the information. The
article writer giving his/her effort to get every word into pleasure arrangement in writing Property of a
Noblewoman: A Novel (Random House Large Print) however doesn't forget the main place, giving the
reader the hottest and also based confirm resource info that maybe you can be one of it. This great
information may drawn you into completely new stage of crucial thinking.
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