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Get all four of the delightful Summer Beach Vets stories in one collection at over 30% discount!
Escape Down Under and fall in love with the hunky veterinarians in the beautiful seaside town of Summer
Beach. Lazy, hot days filled with sunshine, cute native wildlife, sparkling blue water and soft white sand -
not to mention the colourful slang...it's a chance to travel to Australia right from your sofa!

Books in this Box Set:

PLAYING FOR LOVE
Sara needs to escape and a gorgeous seaside town in Australia seems like the perfect place. When she finds a
lost Beagle on the beach, she also finds herself meeting handsome TV veterinarian, Dr Craig Murray. She
vowed that she would never date a celebrity again - she's been burnt too badly before - but now she's
beginning to wonder: should she risk another chance at love?

As a national heartthrob, Craig has women falling at his feet, but he is enchanted by the beautiful, curvy
American. They may come from different cultures - and even speak different "English" sometimes - but he
knows they can have a future together. Can he convince Sara that this is more than just a vacation fling?

PLAYING TO WIN
Ellie Monroe doesn't make mistakes and her dream job in a gorgeous Australian seaside town isn't the place
to start. But when a mischievous chocolate Labrador turns her life upside-down, Ellie finds herself meeting
handsome veterinarian, Dr Dan O'Brien and wanting to throw caution to the wind for the first time in her
life...

Dan has never met a woman quite like Ellie before. The workaholic American is sexy, stubborn, uptight,
exasperating - and absolutely fascinating. Australians are famous for their relaxed attitude to life - but can
Dan convince Ellie that sometimes you need to make mistakes to open your heart to love?

PLAYING BY HEART
Pippa is finally returning to her home in Australia after six years overseas. She's looking forward to enjoying
some sun, sea and sand, with nothing more exciting on the agenda than a job hunt. But Fate has other ideas--
first in the shape of a little stray kitten, then in the form of gorgeous veterinarian Dr Matt Pearson.

Fresh from a painful break-up, Matt is very wary of giving his heart again but there's something about Pippa
that completely captivates him. When his past catches up with him, Matt is forced to make a choice between
playing it safe and taking a gamble on love once more...

PLAYING THE FOOL



Charlie is the youngest vet at a busy animal hospital and passionate about her work. She's horrified when an
injured baby koala is brought in - and even more horrified when she recognises the handsome stranger who
rescued it as her first love. Todd Novak broke her heart once and there's no way she's letting him get under
her defences again!

Todd can't believe that his friend's little sister has grown up into such a beauty. As a dotcom billionaire, he's
used to getting what he wants and suddenly, all he wants is the key to Charlie's heart. But with his playboy
reputation and her bitter memories, can he ever convince Charlie to give him a second chance?
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From reader reviews:

Ana Lopez:

Do you have favorite book? Should you have, what is your favorite's book? Publication is very important
thing for us to learn everything in the world. Each e-book has different aim or goal; it means that guide has
different type. Some people feel enjoy to spend their a chance to read a book. They may be reading whatever
they take because their hobby is usually reading a book. Think about the person who don't like looking at a
book? Sometime, person feel need book if they found difficult problem as well as exercise. Well, probably
you will require this Summer Beach Vets Collection Boxset: Sweet, clean, small town beach romances set
Down Under.

Danny Chamberland:

Reading a e-book can be one of a lot of action that everyone in the world adores. Do you like reading book
so. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoyed. First reading a publication will give you a lot of new
information. When you read a publication you will get new information simply because book is one of
several ways to share the information or perhaps their idea. Second, looking at a book will make anyone
more imaginative. When you looking at a book especially fiction book the author will bring you to imagine
the story how the people do it anything. Third, you may share your knowledge to other people. When you
read this Summer Beach Vets Collection Boxset: Sweet, clean, small town beach romances set Down Under,
you could tells your family, friends as well as soon about yours guide. Your knowledge can inspire the
others, make them reading a book.

Michael Vines:

On this era which is the greater particular person or who has ability to do something more are more special
than other. Do you want to become certainly one of it? It is just simple way to have that. What you have to
do is just spending your time very little but quite enough to get a look at some books. Among the books in
the top collection in your reading list is Summer Beach Vets Collection Boxset: Sweet, clean, small town
beach romances set Down Under. This book that is qualified as The Hungry Mountains can get you closer in
turning out to be precious person. By looking upward and review this publication you can get many
advantages.

Lois Schooley:

Reading a publication make you to get more knowledge from this. You can take knowledge and information
from a book. Book is prepared or printed or illustrated from each source which filled update of news. In this
modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for anyone. From media social
including newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, book and comic. You can add
your understanding by that book. Are you hip to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just searching
for the Summer Beach Vets Collection Boxset: Sweet, clean, small town beach romances set Down Under



when you desired it?
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