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Bullying is a serious and pervasive issue for people with autism and Asperger Syndrome. This photocopiable
workbook encourages adults who have been involved with bullying - as either victims or perpetrators - to
explore what bullying is, the effects it can have and how it can be tackled successfully. In this accessible and
jargon-free book, with a wealth of case studies and summaries, readers are invited to consider the thoughts,
feelings and actions associated with bullying and offered helpful strategies for dealing with it. The book
comprises a general introduction to bullying, followed by sections that examine the issue from the
perspectives of victim and perpetrator. This dual approach is designed to stamp out the problem at its source
- the bully - rather than simply supporting the victim. It also recognises that while people on the spectrum are
all too often bullied for being 'different' character traits such as difficulty with empathy mean they may
unintentionally bully others. This practical book can be worked through independently or with any of the
wide range of professionals involved in supporting an adult with autism or Asperger Syndrome and other
learning disabilities, to reach a new level of understanding about bullying.
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From reader reviews:

Dorothy Shuler:

Information is provisions for those to get better life, information presently can get by anyone in everywhere.
The information can be a know-how or any news even a huge concern. What people must be consider any
time those information which is inside the former life are challenging to be find than now is taking seriously
which one is acceptable to believe or which one often the resource are convinced. If you receive the unstable
resource then you obtain it as your main information there will be huge disadvantage for you. All of those
possibilities will not happen inside you if you take Exploring Bullying with Adults with Autism and
Asperger Syndrome: A Photocopiable Workbook as your daily resource information.

Eugene Flowers:

Reading a e-book tends to be new life style in this era globalization. With examining you can get a lot of
information which will give you benefit in your life. Along with book everyone in this world can certainly
share their idea. Publications can also inspire a lot of people. Lots of author can inspire their particular reader
with their story or their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the guides. But also they write about
advantage about something that you need case in point. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your
young ones, there are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors on this planet always try to
improve their ability in writing, they also doing some exploration before they write with their book. One of
them is this Exploring Bullying with Adults with Autism and Asperger Syndrome: A Photocopiable
Workbook.

Victoria Owen:

People live in this new day time of lifestyle always aim to and must have the time or they will get lot of
stress from both everyday life and work. So , when we ask do people have spare time, we will say absolutely
of course. People is human not really a huge robot. Then we inquire again, what kind of activity do you have
when the spare time coming to you actually of course your answer can unlimited right. Then do you ever try
this one, reading guides. It can be your alternative with spending your spare time, the actual book you have
read is actually Exploring Bullying with Adults with Autism and Asperger Syndrome: A Photocopiable
Workbook.

Alisa Gordon:

You can find this Exploring Bullying with Adults with Autism and Asperger Syndrome: A Photocopiable
Workbook by browse the bookstore or Mall. Just simply viewing or reviewing it may to be your solve
trouble if you get difficulties for ones knowledge. Kinds of this e-book are various. Not only by written or
printed but additionally can you enjoy this book by means of e-book. In the modern era including now, you
just looking by your mobile phone and searching what your problem. Right now, choose your ways to get
more information about your guide. It is most important to arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge



are still up-date. Let's try to choose suitable ways for you.
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