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This book introduces the reader to the main quantitative concepts, methods, and computational techniques
needed for the development, evaluation, and application of tests in the behavioral/social sciences, including
educational tests. Two empirical examples are carried throughout to illustrate alternative methods. Other data
sets are used for special illustrations. Self-contained programs for confirmatory and exploratory factor
analysis are available on the Web.

Intended for students of psychology, particularly educational psychology, as well as social science students
interested in how tests are constructed and used, prerequisites include a course on statistics.

The programs and data files for this book can be downloaded from www.psypress.com/test-theory/
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From reader reviews:

John Lee:

Here thing why that Test Theory: A Unified Treatment are different and dependable to be yours. First of all
studying a book is good nonetheless it depends in the content of it which is the content is as scrumptious as
food or not. Test Theory: A Unified Treatment giving you information deeper since different ways, you can
find any book out there but there is no publication that similar with Test Theory: A Unified Treatment. It
gives you thrill looking at journey, its open up your eyes about the thing in which happened in the world
which is might be can be happened around you. It is easy to bring everywhere like in playground, café, or
even in your way home by train. If you are having difficulties in bringing the printed book maybe the form of
Test Theory: A Unified Treatment in e-book can be your choice.

Betty Norsworthy:

Nowadays reading books be a little more than want or need but also become a life style. This reading
addiction give you lot of advantages. Advantages you got of course the knowledge even the information
inside the book in which improve your knowledge and information. The knowledge you get based on what
kind of guide you read, if you want have more knowledge just go with schooling books but if you want
experience happy read one along with theme for entertaining for example comic or novel. Often the Test
Theory: A Unified Treatment is kind of publication which is giving the reader unforeseen experience.

Jean Gaskin:

Spent a free the perfect time to be fun activity to try and do! A lot of people spent their free time with their
family, or all their friends. Usually they performing activity like watching television, planning to beach, or
picnic inside park. They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Do you wish to something different
to fill your personal free time/ holiday? Could be reading a book may be option to fill your free of charge
time/ holiday. The first thing that you will ask may be what kinds of reserve that you should read. If you
want to consider look for book, may be the book untitled Test Theory: A Unified Treatment can be good
book to read. May be it could be best activity to you.

Matthew Hansen:

A lot of publication has printed but it takes a different approach. You can get it by net on social media. You
can choose the top book for you, science, comedian, novel, or whatever through searching from it. It is
known as of book Test Theory: A Unified Treatment. Contain your knowledge by it. Without leaving the
printed book, it might add your knowledge and make you happier to read. It is most important that, you must
aware about guide. It can bring you from one spot to other place.
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