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Dean has grown up knowing that there are dangerous, spooky, and mysterious mobs out there, but he never
got the chance to get out of his small village to see them. Now that he's thirteen, he thinks that he can finally
go out and do things on his own. But he can’t look for dangerous mobs on his own, though. He’ll need some
help from an expert crew...or a group of teenagers that also want to get out of the village. With the help of
Blair, a monster hunter; Fontaine, a guy looking for revenge on mobs that hurt his family; Emily, a girl who
wants to get over her fears; and Chunky, Emily's pet ocelot, Dean will be able to accomplish his goals. What
is Dean’s goal exactly? He wants to fight some of the most dangerous mobs out there and find out the truth
of the world. Are Ghasts really real? What makes a Blaze tick? What does it take to defeat an Enderman?
Dean only really wants one thing--experience. He wants to be able to say that he’s done all of these great and
exciting things, but he needs to get out and do it first. Will Dean be able to adventure and live to tell the tale?
What will he need to risk to get what he wants? Find out in his diary, The Monster Hunter Diaries.

Other books in The Monster Hunter Diaries
Book 2: Building the Herobrine Totem, http://www.amazon.com/dp/B01BU3VT64/
Book 3: Stopping Herobrine, http://www.amazon.com/dp/B01C8SC09K/

Author’s Note: This short story is for your reading pleasure. The characters in this "Minecraft Adventure
Series" such as Steve, Endermen or Herobrine...etc are based on the Minecraft Game coming from Minecraft
®/TM & © 2009-2013 Mojang / Notch
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From reader reviews:

Jesse Nance:

Now a day folks who Living in the era exactly where everything reachable by talk with the internet and the
resources inside can be true or not require people to be aware of each data they get. How many people to be
smart in acquiring any information nowadays? Of course the reply is reading a book. Looking at a book can
help men and women out of this uncertainty Information particularly this The Monster Hunter Diaries (Book
1): First Quest (An Unofficial Minecraft Book for Kids Ages 9 - 12 (Preteen) book since this book offers you
rich info and knowledge. Of course the details in this book hundred percent guarantees there is no doubt in it
everbody knows.

Gregory Goolsby:

Reading can called head hangout, why? Because when you find yourself reading a book specially book
entitled The Monster Hunter Diaries (Book 1): First Quest (An Unofficial Minecraft Book for Kids Ages 9 -
12 (Preteen) your head will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in every aspect that maybe
unfamiliar for but surely might be your mind friends. Imaging each and every word written in a book then
become one application form conclusion and explanation this maybe you never get ahead of. The The
Monster Hunter Diaries (Book 1): First Quest (An Unofficial Minecraft Book for Kids Ages 9 - 12 (Preteen)
giving you another experience more than blown away your thoughts but also giving you useful info for your
better life in this particular era. So now let us teach you the relaxing pattern at this point is your body and
mind will be pleased when you are finished looking at it, like winning a game. Do you want to try this
extraordinary shelling out spare time activity?

Calvin Lee:

You could spend your free time to see this book this reserve. This The Monster Hunter Diaries (Book 1):
First Quest (An Unofficial Minecraft Book for Kids Ages 9 - 12 (Preteen) is simple bringing you can read it
in the park, in the beach, train as well as soon. If you did not have much space to bring the particular printed
book, you can buy the e-book. It is make you much easier to read it. You can save the actual book in your
smart phone. So there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this book.

Ronnie Johnson:

Is it anyone who having spare time and then spend it whole day by simply watching television programs or
just lying on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This The Monster Hunter Diaries (Book 1): First
Quest (An Unofficial Minecraft Book for Kids Ages 9 - 12 (Preteen) can be the answer, oh how comes? It's a
book you know. You are and so out of date, spending your free time by reading in this brand-new era is
common not a nerd activity. So what these textbooks have than the others?
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