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The Reality Bites Series Books 1-3 Omnibus edition A world class sniper, Cassie Carter sets her sights on
legendary cryptids. She’s also set her sights on fellow Bites agent Hank Smithfield. If you enjoy danger and
adventure with a healthy dose of romance, check out Reality Bites. This omnibus edition contains the first
three exciting novels in the Reality Bites Series which follows the adventures of Cassie Carter, cryptid hunter
and her fellow agents at BITES, the Biological Investigation and Threat Eradication Service. The
Thunderbird OP Cassie Carter is one kickass chick. An entomologist and competitive rifle shooter she loves
the desert and enjoys her life in Las Cruces, New Mexico. An amazing discovery gives Cassie a new view on
reality. Casey goes from discovering the Thunderbirds to hunting them and she’s a very good hunter. Can
she make her mark on BITES and Hank or will the Thunderbirds and her team leader put an end to her career
before it even gets started? The Black Fly Op Someone is using the remote Connecticut Lakes area of New
Hampshire to hide a secret robotics lab and the local residents unwittingly become their test subjects. Hank's
old SEAL buddy, now the sheriff of Coos County, asks Hank for assistance. BITES takes over the
investigation putting some of the team in the cross hairs of international terrorists. The Chupacabra Op The
BITES team of cryptid hunters is on the trail of Chupacabra and Bigfoot in book three of the Reality Bites
Series. Rumors of a reorg at BITES has everyone on edge. Agent Cassie Carter steps up her shooting skills
and makes some life changing decisions. A Chupacabra attack gives Agent Dickenson flashbacks to what
happened to his brother. A fast-paced adventure set in New Mexico and far West Texas with lots of action
and plenty of romantic tension as Cassie gets focused on her targets both personally and professionally.
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From reader reviews:

William Mayer:

The book The Thunderbird Op (Reality Bites Cryptid Hunting Series) (Volume 1) can give more knowledge
and also the precise product information about everything you want. Why then must we leave the great thing
like a book The Thunderbird Op (Reality Bites Cryptid Hunting Series) (Volume 1)? Wide variety you have
a different opinion about reserve. But one aim which book can give many data for us. It is absolutely
suitable. Right now, try to closer with the book. Knowledge or facts that you take for that, you may give for
each other; you may share all of these. Book The Thunderbird Op (Reality Bites Cryptid Hunting Series)
(Volume 1) has simple shape however, you know: it has great and large function for you. You can seem the
enormous world by available and read a book. So it is very wonderful.

Alice Black:

The e-book untitled The Thunderbird Op (Reality Bites Cryptid Hunting Series) (Volume 1) is the reserve
that recommended to you to learn. You can see the quality of the publication content that will be shown to
you actually. The language that publisher use to explained their way of doing something is easily to
understand. The writer was did a lot of research when write the book, therefore the information that they
share for you is absolutely accurate. You also might get the e-book of The Thunderbird Op (Reality Bites
Cryptid Hunting Series) (Volume 1) from the publisher to make you much more enjoy free time.

Yvonne Tetrault:

Do you have something that you prefer such as book? The guide lovers usually prefer to choose book like
comic, limited story and the biggest the first is novel. Now, why not trying The Thunderbird Op (Reality
Bites Cryptid Hunting Series) (Volume 1) that give your pleasure preference will be satisfied by reading this
book. Reading behavior all over the world can be said as the means for people to know world considerably
better then how they react in the direction of the world. It can't be mentioned constantly that reading routine
only for the geeky man or woman but for all of you who wants to possibly be success person. So , for all you
who want to start studying as your good habit, you could pick The Thunderbird Op (Reality Bites Cryptid
Hunting Series) (Volume 1) become your current starter.

Anthony Jones:

Do you like reading a e-book? Confuse to looking for your best book? Or your book had been rare? Why so
many concern for the book? But any kind of people feel that they enjoy intended for reading. Some people
likes examining, not only science book but in addition novel and The Thunderbird Op (Reality Bites Cryptid
Hunting Series) (Volume 1) or even others sources were given understanding for you. After you know how
the fantastic a book, you feel desire to read more and more. Science book was created for teacher or students
especially. Those guides are helping them to include their knowledge. In some other case, beside science
guide, any other book likes The Thunderbird Op (Reality Bites Cryptid Hunting Series) (Volume 1) to make



your spare time much more colorful. Many types of book like here.
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