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Completely up to date with the latest exam changes, Get Through First FRCR: Questions for the
Anatomy Module offers a valuable insight into the new anatomy exam. 170 high quality practice cases,
each containing 5 question stems, are presented according to syllabus topics, accurately reflecting the
content, style and level of difficulty of the actual examination questions.

Anatomical images are included from all modalities commonly used in current radiological practice (plain x-
rays, CT, MRI, ultrasound, nuclear medicine). Each case is supported by full explanatory answers, providing
appropriate anatomy knowledge and relevant radiological learning points for the candidate.

Featuring a wealth of practice questions plus one full mock examination, this book has been designed for
candidates to assess their knowledge, identify topics that require further study and to build up confidence in
preparation for the exam day.

Written by Specialty Trainees in Radiology, Get Through First FRCR: Questions for the Anatomy
Module is the essential revision tool for all First FRCR candidates preparing for the newly revised
examination.
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From reader reviews:

David Lalonde:

With other case, little individuals like to read book Get Through First FRCR: Questions for the Anatomy
Module. You can choose the best book if you love reading a book. Provided that we know about how is
important the book Get Through First FRCR: Questions for the Anatomy Module. You can add
understanding and of course you can around the world with a book. Absolutely right, since from book you
can recognize everything! From your country until finally foreign or abroad you can be known. About simple
matter until wonderful thing you may know that. In this era, we could open a book as well as searching by
internet device. It is called e-book. You may use it when you feel fed up to go to the library. Let's read.

Alvin Pryor:

The reserve untitled Get Through First FRCR: Questions for the Anatomy Module is the reserve that
recommended to you to learn. You can see the quality of the reserve content that will be shown to anyone.
The language that article author use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The author was did a lot
of analysis when write the book, therefore the information that they share for your requirements is absolutely
accurate. You also can get the e-book of Get Through First FRCR: Questions for the Anatomy Module from
the publisher to make you more enjoy free time.

Clair Lemanski:

The book Get Through First FRCR: Questions for the Anatomy Module has a lot of knowledge on it. So
when you read this book you can get a lot of advantage. The book was written by the very famous author.
This articles author makes some research before write this book. This specific book very easy to read you
will get the point easily after reading this article book.

John Keys:

This Get Through First FRCR: Questions for the Anatomy Module is completely new way for you who has
attention to look for some information because it relief your hunger of knowledge. Getting deeper you into it
getting knowledge more you know or perhaps you who still having small amount of digest in reading this
Get Through First FRCR: Questions for the Anatomy Module can be the light food in your case because the
information inside this book is easy to get by means of anyone. These books develop itself in the form that is
certainly reachable by anyone, sure I mean in the e-book web form. People who think that in book form
make them feel tired even dizzy this book is the answer. So there is not any in reading a book especially this
one. You can find actually looking for. It should be here for you actually. So , don't miss that! Just read this
e-book variety for your better life along with knowledge.
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