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Now in its third edition, the ground-breaking Artech House bestseller "SIP: Understanding the Session
Initiation Protocol" offers the most comprehensive and current understanding of this revolutionary protocol
for call signaling and IP Telephony. Essential reading for anyone involved in the development and operation
of voice or data networks, the third edition has been significantly expanded with brand new chapters on SIP
security, services in SIP, presence and instant messaging, and Peer-to-Peer SIP. The book explains how SIP
is a highly-scalable and cost-effective way to offer new and exciting telecommunication feature sets. From
an examination of SIP as a key component in the Internet multimedia conferencing architecture...to a look at
the future direction of SIP, practitioners get the knowledge they need to design 'next generation' networks
and develop new applications and software stacks. This title is suitable for telecommunications/wireless
engineers and professionals, professors and students whose work involves voice or data networks and the
Internet multimedia architecture.
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From reader reviews:

Michelle Beltran:

This book untitled SIP: Understanding the Session Initiation Protocol (Artech House Telecommunications)
to be one of several books that best seller in this year, that is because when you read this reserve you can get
a lot of benefit on it. You will easily to buy this book in the book retail outlet or you can order it via online.
The publisher on this book sells the e-book too. It makes you more easily to read this book, as you can read
this book in your Touch screen phone. So there is no reason for you to past this reserve from your list.

Crystal Scott:

You may get this SIP: Understanding the Session Initiation Protocol (Artech House Telecommunications) by
go to the bookstore or Mall. Only viewing or reviewing it could possibly to be your solve problem if you get
difficulties on your knowledge. Kinds of this guide are various. Not only by means of written or printed but
can you enjoy this book by e-book. In the modern era just like now, you just looking from your mobile
phone and searching what their problem. Right now, choose your own ways to get more information about
your publication. It is most important to arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are still update.
Let's try to choose proper ways for you.

Terry Brown:

Publication is one of source of expertise. We can add our know-how from it. Not only for students but
additionally native or citizen need book to know the change information of year to year. As we know those
textbooks have many advantages. Beside we add our knowledge, could also bring us to around the world.
With the book SIP: Understanding the Session Initiation Protocol (Artech House Telecommunications) we
can have more advantage. Don't one to be creative people? To become creative person must prefer to read a
book. Just choose the best book that appropriate with your aim. Don't be doubt to change your life with this
book SIP: Understanding the Session Initiation Protocol (Artech House Telecommunications). You can more
appealing than now.

Melinda Walton:

Reading a book make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information from
the book. Book is written or printed or illustrated from each source that filled update of news. Within this
modern era like now, many ways to get information are available for you. From media social including
newspaper, magazines, science guide, encyclopedia, reference book, story and comic. You can add your
understanding by that book. Isn't it time to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just looking
for the SIP: Understanding the Session Initiation Protocol (Artech House Telecommunications) when you
needed it?
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