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Ever since he was a kid, Larry Noto dreamt of being a comic. And eventually his dream of a career in stand-
up came true . . . sort of. He's performed in New York and Las Vegas. He's worked in TV and radio. He's
opened for the biggest names in the business, including Brian Regan, Lewis Black, Paul Reiser, Bob Saget
and Richard Lewis. But while he's been lucky to hone his comedy chops with the greats, Larry admits he
never really went for it. Never moved to Manhattan or L.A., never played every soul-sucking open-mic night
and 1 a.m. gig in front of 50 drunks, hoping it would be his ticket to success. That's what this book is about,
too. It's about having a dream, getting a taste of it, but always knowing you weren't willing to risk it all to get
to the very top. It's about finding happiness in what you've accomplished, versus dwelling on what you
haven't. It's about discovering a life purpose and defining success based on that - not the judgment or
perception of others. It's about remaining the opening act - and finally finding a quiet joy in oneself.
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From reader reviews:

Mildred Parker:

Do you have favorite book? In case you have, what is your favorite's book? E-book is very important thing
for us to understand everything in the world. Each reserve has different aim or even goal; it means that
reserve has different type. Some people truly feel enjoy to spend their time and energy to read a book. They
can be reading whatever they acquire because their hobby is reading a book. Consider the person who don't
like reading through a book? Sometime, man or woman feel need book when they found difficult problem as
well as exercise. Well, probably you'll have this The Opening Act: Comedy, Life & the Desperate Pursuit of
Happiness.

Vera Gates:

The book untitled The Opening Act: Comedy, Life & the Desperate Pursuit of Happiness contain a lot of
information on this. The writer explains the girl idea with easy means. The language is very clear and
understandable all the people, so do not necessarily worry, you can easy to read the idea. The book was
written by famous author. The author provides you in the new time of literary works. You can read this book
because you can continue reading your smart phone, or gadget, so you can read the book within anywhere
and anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can start their official web-site as well as
order it. Have a nice go through.

Jerry Hull:

You could spend your free time you just read this book this reserve. This The Opening Act: Comedy, Life &
the Desperate Pursuit of Happiness is simple bringing you can read it in the recreation area, in the beach,
train in addition to soon. If you did not possess much space to bring the printed book, you can buy often the
e-book. It is make you better to read it. You can save typically the book in your smart phone. So there are a
lot of benefits that you will get when you buy this book.

Elbert Lupton:

As a scholar exactly feel bored to help reading. If their teacher questioned them to go to the library or even
make summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just very little students that has reading's internal or
real their leisure activity. They just do what the trainer want, like asked to go to the library. They go to right
now there but nothing reading very seriously. Any students feel that examining is not important, boring
along with can't see colorful pictures on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important for you.
As we know that on this era, many ways to get whatever we wish. Likewise word says, many ways to reach
Chinese's country. So , this The Opening Act: Comedy, Life & the Desperate Pursuit of Happiness can make
you experience more interested to read.
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