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This volume contains the papers presented at the IUTAM Symposium on Geometry and Statistics of
Turbulence, held in November 1999, at the Shonan International Village Center, Hayama (Kanagawa-ken),
Japan. The Symposium was proposed in 1996, aiming at organizing concen trated discussions on current
understanding of fluid turbulence with empha sis on the statistics and the underlying geometric structures.
The decision of the General Assembly of International Union of Theoretical and Applied Mechanics
(IUTAM) to accept the proposal was greeted with enthusiasm. Turbulence is often characterized as having
the properties of mixing, inter mittency, non-Gaussian statistics, and so on. Interest is growing recently in
how these properties are related to formation and evolution of struc tures. Note that the intermittency is
meant for passive scalars as well as for turbulence velocity or rate of dissipation. There were eighty-eight
participants in the Symposium. They came from thirteen countries, and fifty-seven papers were presented.
The presenta tions comprised a wide variety of fundamental subjects of mathematics, statistical analyses,
physical models as well as engineering applications. Among the subjects discussed are (a) Degree of self-
similarity in cascade, (b) Fine-scale structures and degree of Markovian property in turbulence, (c) Dynamics
of vorticity and rates of strain, (d) Statistics associated with vortex structures, (e) Topology, structures and
statistics of passive scalar advection, (f) Partial differential equations governing PDFs of velocity in
crements, (g) Thermal turbulences, (h) Channel and pipe flow turbulences, and others.
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From reader reviews:

Madeline Wayt:

Book is to be different for each and every grade. Book for children until eventually adult are different
content. To be sure that book is very important for people. The book IUTAM Symposium on Geometry and
Statistics of Turbulence - Held at the Shonan International Village Center, Hayama (Kanagawa-ken), Japan,
November 1--5, 1999 seemed to be making you to know about other information and of course you can take
more information. It is very advantages for you. The publication IUTAM Symposium on Geometry and
Statistics of Turbulence - Held at the Shonan International Village Center, Hayama (Kanagawa-ken), Japan,
November 1--5, 1999 is not only giving you a lot more new information but also to be your friend when you
sense bored. You can spend your own spend time to read your reserve. Try to make relationship with all the
book IUTAM Symposium on Geometry and Statistics of Turbulence - Held at the Shonan International
Village Center, Hayama (Kanagawa-ken), Japan, November 1--5, 1999. You never truly feel lose out for
everything when you read some books.

Malcolm Lee:

IUTAM Symposium on Geometry and Statistics of Turbulence - Held at the Shonan International Village
Center, Hayama (Kanagawa-ken), Japan, November 1--5, 1999 can be one of your basic books that are good
idea. All of us recommend that straight away because this guide has good vocabulary that could increase
your knowledge in language, easy to understand, bit entertaining but delivering the information. The article
writer giving his/her effort to place every word into delight arrangement in writing IUTAM Symposium on
Geometry and Statistics of Turbulence - Held at the Shonan International Village Center, Hayama
(Kanagawa-ken), Japan, November 1--5, 1999 although doesn't forget the main place, giving the reader the
hottest in addition to based confirm resource details that maybe you can be considered one of it. This great
information may drawn you into new stage of crucial considering.

Becky Pope:

A lot of publication has printed but it differs from the others. You can get it by world wide web on social
media. You can choose the most effective book for you, science, witty, novel, or whatever by means of
searching from it. It is referred to as of book IUTAM Symposium on Geometry and Statistics of Turbulence -
Held at the Shonan International Village Center, Hayama (Kanagawa-ken), Japan, November 1--5, 1999.
You can add your knowledge by it. Without leaving behind the printed book, it might add your knowledge
and make anyone happier to read. It is most important that, you must aware about book. It can bring you
from one destination for a other place.

Betty Abbott:

What is your hobby? Have you heard which question when you got scholars? We believe that that concern



was given by teacher to their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every individual has different hobby. So you
know that little person just like reading or as examining become their hobby. You need to know that reading
is very important along with book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to increase you knowledge,
except your personal teacher or lecturer. You discover good news or update with regards to something by
book. Amount types of books that can you decide to try be your object. One of them is niagra IUTAM
Symposium on Geometry and Statistics of Turbulence - Held at the Shonan International Village Center,
Hayama (Kanagawa-ken), Japan, November 1--5, 1999.
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