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Achieve your goals and attain optimum health. Make this journal your exercise buddy! Keep track of those
trips to the gym, workouts at home -- all your hard work and dedication.

Includes daily pages to record cardiovascular activity, flexibility/balance classes, strength training sessions,●

and vitamins or supplements.
''Goals met'' checkboxes and space for jotting down a few extra notes help you detail your workouts.●

If you use the gym every day, you'll find this sleek journal provides enough pages for nearly 3 months.●

If you go less often, it may last 6 months or more.●

It also includes weekly progress charts, enough for up to 60 weeks.●

The journal even packs in solid basic information on cardio, flexibility, strength training, tracking calories,●

tracking your progress, plus fitness tips and tricks and a list of online resources.
The journal is adaptable for different programs.●

Removable cover band.●

194 pages.●

Binding lies flat for ease of use.●

4-1/2 inches wide x 7-1/2 inches high.●
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From reader reviews:

Lauren Barnett:

What do you concentrate on book? It is just for students because they're still students or it for all people in
the world, the actual best subject for that? Simply you can be answered for that problem above. Every person
has different personality and hobby per other. Don't to be pushed someone or something that they don't
desire do that. You must know how great and also important the book Workout Journal (Diary, Notebook,
Fitness). All type of book can you see on many solutions. You can look for the internet solutions or other
social media.

Judy Young:

Reading a publication can be one of a lot of exercise that everyone in the world enjoys. Do you like reading
book consequently. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoy it. First reading a book will give you a lot of
new info. When you read a book you will get new information mainly because book is one of many ways to
share the information or even their idea. Second, reading through a book will make you actually more
imaginative. When you reading through a book especially fictional book the author will bring that you
imagine the story how the personas do it anything. Third, you could share your knowledge to other
individuals. When you read this Workout Journal (Diary, Notebook, Fitness), you could tells your family,
friends along with soon about yours book. Your knowledge can inspire the others, make them reading a
guide.

Jose Jones:

Do you have something that you prefer such as book? The publication lovers usually prefer to select book
like comic, brief story and the biggest an example may be novel. Now, why not hoping Workout Journal
(Diary, Notebook, Fitness) that give your entertainment preference will be satisfied by means of reading this
book. Reading habit all over the world can be said as the means for people to know world far better then how
they react in the direction of the world. It can't be explained constantly that reading behavior only for the
geeky man or woman but for all of you who wants to always be success person. So , for all of you who want
to start studying as your good habit, it is possible to pick Workout Journal (Diary, Notebook, Fitness)
become your starter.

Kathryn Kern:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray an individual, why because this Workout Journal (Diary, Notebook,
Fitness) guide written by well-known writer whose to say well how to make book that could be understand
by anyone who all read the book. Written in good manner for you, still dripping wet every ideas and writing
skill only for eliminate your hunger then you still hesitation Workout Journal (Diary, Notebook, Fitness) as
good book not only by the cover but also by content. This is one book that can break don't ascertain book by
its deal with, so do you still needing another sixth sense to pick that!? Oh come on your examining sixth
sense already said so why you have to listening to yet another sixth sense.
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