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On the island of Maui in Hawaii, a sixteen-year-old international spy named Rio Kayenta discovers a two-
thousand-year-old coral stone. Legend has it that the stone is meant for a girl named Amber and that with it,
she can stop the evil S.H.R.O.U.D. organization.

Amber Page lives in the Arizona desert and wants one thing more than anything else in the world: to see her
mom and dad back together again. Amber's mom is a school bus driver who has split with her dad, but
Amber believes the two still love one another.

When a strange old man stops at nothing to tell Amber that the legendary stone is meant for her, it frightens
her and her family deeply. It is a race against the clock to get the stone to Amber and to see if she will realize
its legendary powers. For with the stone strengthening her, Amber may be able to save her family and the
world.
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From reader reviews:

Christopher Gaul:

Do you have favorite book? If you have, what is your favorite's book? Publication is very important thing for
us to know everything in the world. Each reserve has different aim or even goal; it means that reserve has
different type. Some people really feel enjoy to spend their time for you to read a book. They can be reading
whatever they have because their hobby is actually reading a book. Consider the person who don't like
reading through a book? Sometime, person feel need book whenever they found difficult problem or perhaps
exercise. Well, probably you'll have this Amber Page and the Legend of the Coral Stone.

Jennifer Joseph:

This Amber Page and the Legend of the Coral Stone usually are reliable for you who want to be described as
a successful person, why. The explanation of this Amber Page and the Legend of the Coral Stone can be
among the great books you must have is usually giving you more than just simple studying food but feed you
with information that might be will shock your before knowledge. This book is definitely handy, you can
bring it everywhere you go and whenever your conditions throughout the e-book and printed types. Beside
that this Amber Page and the Legend of the Coral Stone forcing you to have an enormous of experience like
rich vocabulary, giving you trial run of critical thinking that could it useful in your day action. So , let's have
it appreciate reading.

William Patterson:

That e-book can make you to feel relax. This book Amber Page and the Legend of the Coral Stone was
multi-colored and of course has pictures on there. As we know that book Amber Page and the Legend of the
Coral Stone has many kinds or genre. Start from kids until adolescents. For example Naruto or Investigator
Conan you can read and think you are the character on there. Therefore , not at all of book usually are make
you bored, any it offers up you feel happy, fun and rest. Try to choose the best book to suit your needs and
try to like reading that.

Ryan Barrett:

As a scholar exactly feel bored for you to reading. If their teacher asked them to go to the library or to make
summary for some book, they are complained. Just little students that has reading's heart or real their hobby.
They just do what the teacher want, like asked to the library. They go to presently there but nothing reading
seriously. Any students feel that looking at is not important, boring in addition to can't see colorful
photographs on there. Yeah, it is being complicated. Book is very important for you. As we know that on this
period of time, many ways to get whatever we really wish for. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's
country. Therefore this Amber Page and the Legend of the Coral Stone can make you truly feel more
interested to read.
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