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Whether you're a wine connoisseur or just a wine lover who loves to throw a party, this complete kit is for
you.

Dan Amatuzzi's How to Host a Wine Tasting Party contains everything you'll need to host a wine tasting in
your own home. A wine-tasting party is fun and educational for everyone from novices to sophisticated wine
drinkers. Dan Amatuzzi is the beverage director at Eataly, where he manages the wine program and teaches
classes at Eataly?s education center, La Scuola. He is also an adjunct professor at NYU?s Steinhardt School
of Culture, Education, and Human Development and the author of A First Course in Wine: From Grape to
Glass.

Within this all-inclusive kit are the elements to be a terrific host—including wine glass markers, wine bottle
covers, tasting notepads, a wine-aroma wheel, a wine-and-cheese wheel, and an entertaining and informative
book that introduces you to the ins and outs of wine in a comfortable, festive, social setting—your own
home.

So grab some glasses, start pouring, and let’s have a party!

Includes all the wine-tasting party essentials:

80-page book with full-color photography●

Wine-aroma wheel●

Wine-and-cheese wheel●

Four numbered tags for wine bottles●

Four reusable cloth wine bottle covers●

Four tasting notepads●
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From reader reviews:

Danielle Rhodes:

Now a day folks who Living in the era wherever everything reachable by connect to the internet and the
resources in it can be true or not require people to be aware of each facts they get. How individuals to be
smart in receiving any information nowadays? Of course the answer is reading a book. Reading a book can
help individuals out of this uncertainty Information mainly this How to Host a Wine Tasting Party: The
Complete Kit book as this book offers you rich information and knowledge. Of course the knowledge in this
book hundred per-cent guarantees there is no doubt in it you know.

Jake Leslie:

This How to Host a Wine Tasting Party: The Complete Kit are reliable for you who want to be considered a
successful person, why. The reason of this How to Host a Wine Tasting Party: The Complete Kit can be one
of the great books you must have will be giving you more than just simple looking at food but feed anyone
with information that probably will shock your preceding knowledge. This book is actually handy, you can
bring it everywhere you go and whenever your conditions in the e-book and printed ones. Beside that this
How to Host a Wine Tasting Party: The Complete Kit giving you an enormous of experience for example
rich vocabulary, giving you test of critical thinking that could it useful in your day activity. So , let's have it
and luxuriate in reading.

Amy Rodriguez:

Within this era which is the greater particular person or who has ability in doing something more are more
special than other. Do you want to become among it? It is just simple solution to have that. What you need to
do is just spending your time almost no but quite enough to have a look at some books. One of many books
in the top record in your reading list is actually How to Host a Wine Tasting Party: The Complete Kit. This
book that is certainly qualified as The Hungry Slopes can get you closer in becoming precious person. By
looking up and review this guide you can get many advantages.

Mary Norman:

That book can make you to feel relax. This particular book How to Host a Wine Tasting Party: The
Complete Kit was bright colored and of course has pictures on the website. As we know that book How to
Host a Wine Tasting Party: The Complete Kit has many kinds or style. Start from kids until teenagers. For
example Naruto or Investigation company Conan you can read and think that you are the character on there.
Therefore not at all of book tend to be make you bored, any it offers you feel happy, fun and loosen up. Try
to choose the best book for you personally and try to like reading that.
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